
Where Is My Boy 
Tonight? 

Hymn by Robert Lowry, 1877 
 

Where is my 

wandering boy 
tonight— 

The boy of my 
tenderest 

care, 

The boy that 
was once my 
joy and light, 

The child of my love and prayer? 
Chorus: 
O where is my boy tonight? 

O where is my boy tonight? 
My heart o’erflows, for I love 
him, he knows; 

O where is my boy tonight? 
 

Once he was pure as morning 

dew, 
As he knelt at his mother’s knee; 

No face was as bright, no heart 
more true, 

And none was so sweet as he. 

Continued on Page 4 

4 

Visit: www.OpenThouMineEyes.com                         Vol.: 388 

The Covetous Son   
Bill Brinkworth  

The two sons were quite dif-
ferent from each other.  The oldest 
was a faithful, hard worker.  Sel-
dom did he miss a day’s work.  
Rain or shine, he was found in the 
fields caring for his father’s crops. 

However, this could not be 
said about the youngest.  It was 
always hard for him to be on time.  
Many times, he just did not show 
up. The truth was he just did not 
like to work.  When he was at 
work, his mind was far from what 
he was doing. 

Much of the time, he would 
daydream about what he would do 
if he had a lot of money.  “Oh, the 
places I would  visit;  the clothes I 
would wear.  Why, even my 
friends would be the best: princes, 
dukes, and maybe even kings.” 

On and on these ideas went 
through his mind.  The more he 
thought and daydreamed, the 
more important they seemed to 
him.   Soon,  most  of  his  waking 
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The Prodigal Son  

Where Is My Boy ... 
Continued from Page 1 

 

Chorus: 

O where is my boy tonight? 
O where is my boy tonight? 
My heart o’erflows, for I love him, 

he knows; 
O where is my boy tonight? 

 

O could I see you now, my boy, 

As fair as in olden time, 

When prattle and smile made 

home a joy, 
And life was a merry chime! 

Chorus: 

 
Go for my wandering boy tonight; 
Go search for him where you will; 

But bring him to me with all his 
blight, 

And tell him I love him still. 
Chorus: 

 “Not that I speak in respect of want: for I have learned, in 
whatsoever state I am, therewith to be content.”— Philippians 4:11 
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time was spent thinking 
about his dream of being 
wealthy. Because of his 
discontentment, work be-
came more dissatisfying to him.   

As his hatred for his job on the 
family estate grew, he began to 
think of ways to get out of this 
‘poor man’s life,’ and how to get 
money so he could live the care-
free life he desired. Finally, an 
idea came to him.  His father was 
very wealthy.  He had fields, cat-
tle, servants, and money!  When 
his father would eventually die, he 
would endow all of it to his sons; 
so why wait until that happened.  
Besides, that could be a long time 
off, and the youngest son wanted 
the money – now! 

He waited for his father to be 
in a good mood, and approached 
him with the idea. On and on he 
whined and complained to his fa-
ther. 

At first, his father was against 
the idea; but as the son com-
plained and showed how he hated 
his life; the father succumbed to 
his son’s pleas.  All was divided, 
and the half was given to the son.   

The day arrived when the son 
left with his half of his birthright.  
It was more money than he had 
ever seen.  “Oh, what a wonderful 
life this money will give me,” he 
thought. 

After he arrived in town, he 
first rented himself one of the nic-
est, most exclusive apartments.  
“Surely, any one that lives here 
could not possibly ride an old nag 

as I have.”  Off he went to get 
himself one of the most beautiful 
carriages and team of horses he 
had ever seen.  “Certainly, a man 
of my stature and wealth must 
have finer clothes.”  Off he went 
again to dress himself in the best 
clothing money could buy. 

What a sight this transformed 
farm-boy was.  Soon this elo-
quent, young man was the talk of 
the town.  People stopped to stare 
as his stately team of horses 
pranced by pulling his carriage.  
The parties and balls this young 
man had were unmatched by any.  
All were invited, and most came. 

His house was the center of 
attraction.  Visitors were always 
coming and going.  He was al-
ways surrounded by ‘friends’.  
Word of his generosity spread 
and many took advantage of his 
giving.   

Shortly, the money ran out.  
The parties stopped.  Buying of 
clothes stopped.  Money lending 
halted.  Soon buying food, and 
paying the rent even came to a 
grinding stop.  The carriage and 
horses were sold to pay some of 
the bills.  There was no money 
left. 

“Surely, my friends will help 
me,” he believed.  Soon he was 
discouraged, as one ‘friend’ after 
another turned his requests down.  
Many looked at him strangely.  
Many even avoided him.  He was 
all alone with no friends; no 
money; nowhere to go.  He was 
forced to leave town. 

A couple of miles outside 
town he was able to find a place 

to work.  It was a terrible job, but 
it was either work there or starve.  
His job was to look over a herd of 
pigs.  They were not penned in; so 
he had to roam the countryside 
with them.  Even more humiliat-
ing were the poor wages he was 
given.  He could not afford to buy 
his meals and was forced to eat 
what was fed to the hogs.  “How 
low could a fellow go?” he surely 
thought. 

Soon he remembered his days 
working for his father on the farm.  
His father was good to him.  Yes, 
the way they lived was quite hum-
ble, but look at the son now.  How 
foolish he had been.  How waste-
ful he had been with his father’s 
money.  How stupid he had been 
to believe that all those people 
were his friends. “If only I hadn’t 
left my father.  Even his servants 
are fed better than this.  I have 
done foolishly, and have sinned 
against God,” he thought. 

He left his hog-sitting job, and 
headed home.  He was ready to 
apologize and do whatever it took 
to get right with his father; even if 
he were rejected. As he neared the 
farmhouse, his father saw him 
from afar.  “My son, my son,” his 
father shouted, as he ran to hug his 
returning, wayward son.   

A party was thrown in celebra-
tion of the young son’s return.  All 
between father and son was for-
given.  The foolish son was re-
ceived back into the household.  
What was lost was found. 

This is part of a fictional ac-
count of a parable taught by Jesus 
in Luke 15.  Although a parable, I 
am sure this account has happened 

thousands of times.  There are 
always foolish people discontent 
with what they have; always 
wanting “greener pastures.”  

As with all sin, the sin of cov-
etousness leads to loss: loss of 
contentment, loss of self-
satisfaction, loss of contentment 
with God’s gifts to us, and many 
times, the loss of personal gain. 

The glitter of things is not the 
sin.  The sin is in not being happy 
with what God has given and 
wanting something else He chose 
not to give us.  Covetousness is 
increased today by television’s 
ads tempting us to get something 
bigger and better than what we 
have; or fads to prod us to get 
something else; or even peer 
pressure to persuade us that what 
we have is not good enough. Our 
covetousness is sin. It had led to 
loss and separation from friend, 
family,  and  God  for  this prodi-
gal son that Jesus spoke of 2,000 
years ago, and it will do the same 
today. 

The good news this parable 
teaches is if you have been led by 
your lusts to do wrong, there is a 
way back: repentance.  Turn from 
your sin, as did the prodigal son, 
and turn back to where God 
placed you originally.  God could 
have given you all the riches in 
the world, but he knows that per-
haps you are not ready for them, 
or could never handle them.  
Trust Him.  He knows what is 
best for your life.  He will forgive 
and will accept you back, as did 
the prodigal’s father in Luke. 
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